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Notification of Cancellation of Purchase of Shares of eAccess Ltd.  
(Conversion to Consolidated Subsidiary) and Future Cooperation, 

and Revision in Consolidated Performance Estimates 
 

On March 27, 2014, Yahoo Japan Corporation announced in its IR release “Notification of 
Purchase of Shares of eAccess Ltd. (Conversion to Consolidated Subsidiary)” that it would 
purchase shares (hereinafter the Transaction) of eAccess Ltd. (hereinafter eAccess) from 
SoftBank Corp. (hereinafter SoftBank). However, as a result of in-depth discussions 
following the announcement, the Board of Directors of Yahoo Japan Corporation decided 
in a meeting held today to cancel the purchase of eAccess shares and conversion to a 
consolidated subsidiary. Details are as follows. 

After the announcement of the Transaction on March 27, 2014, Yahoo Japan Corporation 
and SoftBank held further in-depth discussions on the mutual use of networks, service 
design, etc., coming to a deeper mutual understanding of the details of the Transaction. 
As a result, Yahoo Japan Corporation came to the conclusion that rather than converting 
eAccess to a consolidated subsidiary and building an infrastructure on its own, it would be 
better to develop the business by employing the strengths of each company, with Yahoo 
Japan Corporation responsible for services and eAccess for infrastructure. Consequently, 
the Transaction has been cancelled.   

eAccess and WILLCOM, Inc., are still scheduled to merge with an effective date of June 1, 
2014. The name of the merging company (hereinafter the new company) is planned to be  
Ymobile Corporation in the future. Working in close collaboration with Yahoo Japan 
Corporation, the new company will take over the concept of “Delivering the Joy and 
Convenience of the Internet to Every Hand” put forth by Yahoo Japan Corporation at the 
time of the original announcement on March 27, 2014. In addition, the two companies will 
jointly offer new service developed using Yahoo Japan Corporation’s strength under the 
new brand name of Y!mobile. Yahoo Japan Corporation will announce the content of the 
new service as soon as it becomes fixed. Discussions will also begin with a view to having 
the various schemes implemented by Y!mobile expanded to SoftBank Mobile Corp.  
 
As indicated in the title of the IR release, along with the cancellation of the purchase of 
shares of eAccess, Yahoo Japan Corporation is making the following revision in its 
consolidated performance estimates announced on April 25, 2014.  

 

●About Revision in Consolidated Performance Estimates 

Revision of Consolidated Performance Estimates for the first half of the fiscal year ending 
March 2015 (April 1, 2014 to September 30, 2014).  

 
Revenue Operating income 

Previous forecast (A) 
Millions of yen 

335,900 
Millions of yen 

93,400 

Revised forecast (B) 211,900 93,400 



Change 

Amount 
(B-A) -124,000 ― 

% -36.9 ― 

Previous record 
(FY2013 first half) 188,040 97,880 

 

Reason for Revision in Consolidated Performance Estimates 
As outlined in Yahoo Japan Corporation’s IR release “Notification of Purchase of Shares 
of eAccess Ltd. (Conversion to Consolidated Subsidiary)” dated March 27, 2014, the 
transfer of shares to Yahoo Japan Corporation was scheduled to occur on June 2, 2014. 
However, as indicated above, the transaction has been cancelled. The consolidated 
performance estimates for the first half of the fiscal year ending March 31, 2015 (April 1, 
2014 to September 30, 2014) announced by Yahoo Japan Corporation on April 25, 2014 
included a ¥124,000 million increase in revenue related to the conversion of eAccess to a 
consolidated subsidiary. As a result of the cancellation of the transfer of shares, there will 
be no impact from consolidation and therefore no increase in revenue due to consolidation.  
No revision has been made to the estimate for consolidated operating income for the same 
period. 
 
Note: The actual consolidated performance figures for the prior fiscal year were prepared using generally 
accepted Japanese accounting principles. However, International Financial Reporting Standards (IFRS) 
were adopted for the consolidated performance estimates of the current fiscal year.  

 


